
Reciprocities for November 13, 2008 Board Meeting 
 

Wastewater 
 
Richard Risoldi holds a C2 collection system license and a 
S2 Public Wastewater license in New Jersey. Both licenses 
expire 9/30/09.  He worked 19 years for the Middlesex Water 
Company and subsidiaries. The experience he submitted for 
the Pinelands Wastewater Company (WWCE 2,4) seems to 
be management experience not operating.  Requesting the 
Board to make the determination. 
 
 
Timothy McFarland has 2 years experience at the Whiteman 
A.F.B. water/wastewater system as an Environmental 
Support Specialist.  The wastewater system is a WWBE 1, 4.  
He is currently employed at the Mercer Boro WWTP in 
Pennsylvania which is a WWCE 2, 4 system.  He has 1 year 
experience at that system.  Do we count his PA experience 
towards his reciprocity experience? 
 
The Board should issue a WWBE 1, 4 certificate unless the 
determination is made to count PA experience.   
 
Kelly Bothur holds a Grade 1 Wastewater Treatment Plant 
Operator license in New Hampshire which expires 12/31/09.  
She has 2 years 1 month experience working at the 
Peterborough WWTP. This is a class C system with a flow of 
500,000 GPD and subclasses 3 and 4. 
 
The Board should issue a WWCE 3, 4 certificate. 



 
Water 
 
Richard Risoldi holds a T4 water treatment license and a W3 
water distribution license in New Jersey. Both licenses 
expire 9/30/09.  He worked 19 years for the Middlesex Water 
Company and subsidiaries with experience in subclasses 1, 
7, 8, 9, 10, 11,12 and distribution.  Middlesex Water 
Company is a Class A system. (36 million GPD) 
 
The Board should issue a WAE 1,7,8,9,10,11,12 certificate. 
 
Daniel Angove holds a Class A water treatment license in 
Florida that expires 4/30/2009.  He has 5 years 6 months 
experience working for the City of Clearwater water 
treatment plant.  This is a Class AE system (13 million GPD) 
with subclasses 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 12.  
 
The Board should issue a WAE 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 12 
certificate. 
 
Michael Kidston holds a Class I water supply operator 
license in Ohio.  He has 6 years 5 months experience 
working at Artesian of Pioneer.  He submitted information for 
6 different systems.  Please refer to the technical review of 
the application for comments and recommendations.  The 
technical review is page 12 of the PDF file that was e-mailed 
to the Board. 
 
The Board should issue a WB 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 
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